Event Number

E-27-22

Event Title MULCH
Event Type ITB

Issue Date 9/8/2022 08:21:32 PM (ET)
Close Date 9/26/2022 02:00:00 PM (ET)

Responding Supplier City State Response Submitted Lines Responded | Response Total
Advanced Mulch, Inc. Palm Beach Gardens FL 9/21/2022 01:34:13 PM (ET) 4 $3,043,729.67
East Coast Mulch Jupiter FL 9/20/2022 04:18:12 PM (ET) 12 $3,605,329.00
IAMWHOIAM, LLC Pompano Beach FL 9/26/2022 01:59:10 PM (ET) 12 $11,237,528.20
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| 1 [Mulch, bulk, delivered, red

Supplier QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended # of yards per truckload Minimum order

East Coast Mulch 20950 |Cubic Yards $25.00 $523,750.00] |50 yards / 100 yards 50 yards
100 cubic yards per tractor |100 cubic yards
trailer 50 yards per dump please see notes
truck see notes for prices for prices of orders
per cubic yard under 100 less than 100 cubic

IAMWHOIAM, LLC 20950 |Cubic Yards $38.50 $806,575.00( |cubic yards yards

Advanced Mulch, Inc. 20950 [Cubic Yards No Bid

| 2 [Mulch, bulk, delivered, brown

Supplier QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended # of yards per truckload Minimum order

East Coast Mulch 5750 |Cubic Yards $25.00 $143,750.00] |50 yards / 100 yards 50 yards
100 cubic yards per tractor |100 cubic yards
trailer 50 yards per dump please see notes
truck see notes for prices for prices of orders
per cubic yard under 100 less than 100 cubic

IAMWHOIAM, LLC 5750 |Cubic Yards $38.50 $221,375.00( |cubic yards yards

Advanced Mulch, Inc. 5750 |[Cubic Yards No Bid

| 3 |Mu|ch, bulk, delivered, gold

Supplier QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended # of yards per truckload Minimum order

East Coast Mulch 14400 |Cubic Yards $25.00 $360,000.00] |50 yards / 100 yards 50 yards
100 cubic yards per tractor [100 cubic yards
trailer 10 to 50 yards per please see notes
dump truck see notes for for prices of orders
prices per cubic yard under [less than 100 cubic

IAMWHOIAM, LLC 14400 |Cubic Yards $38.50 $554,400.00| |100 cubic yards yards

Advanced Mulch, Inc. 14400 |Cubic Yards No Bid
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| 4 |Mu|ch, bulk, delivered, melaleuca

Supplier QTY (UuoMm Unit Price Extended # of yards per truckload Minimum order
East Coast Mulch 400 |Cubic Yards $23.00 $9,200.00( |50 yards / 100 yards 50 yards
50 cubic yards per dump

IAMWHOIAM, LLC 400 Cubic Yards $45.00 $18,000.00] |truck 20 cubic yards
Advanced Mulch, Inc. 400 |Cubic Yards No Bid

| 5 |Mu|ch, bagged, delivered, red
Supplier QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended # of bags per pallet Minimum order
East Coast Mulch 4640 |Bags $2.45 $11,368.00] |80 bags per pallet 15 pallet minimum
IAMWHOIAM, LLC 4640 |[Bags $3.10 $14,384.00] (70 20 pallets
Advanced Mulch, Inc. 4640 |(Bags No Bid

| 6 |Mu|ch, bagged, delivered, brown
Supplier QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended # of bags per pallet Minimum order
East Coast Mulch 23200 |Bags $2.50 $58,000.00] |70 bags per pallet 15 pallet minimum
IAMWHOIAM, LLC 23200 |Bags $3.10 $71,920.00] (70 20 pallets
Advanced Mulch, Inc. 23200 |Bags No Bid

| 7 |Mu|ch, bagged, delivered, melaleuca
Supplier QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended # of bags per pallet Minimum Order
East Coast Mulch 7560 |Bags $2.35 $17,766.00] |80 bags per pallet 15 pallet minimum
IAMWHOIAM, LLC 7560 |Bags $4.32 $32,659.20( |75 10 pallets
ADVANCED MULCH INC 7560 |[Bags No Bid
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| 8 |Engineered Wood Fiber, bulk, installed

Supplier QTY (UuoMm Unit Price Extended Minimum order
East Coast Mulch 4700 [Cubic Yards $40.00 $188,000.00( |50 yards
IAMWHOIAM, LLC 4700 |Cubic Yards $155.00 $728,500.00] |50 cubic yards
Advanced Mulch, Inc. 4700 [Cubic Yards No Bid

| 9 |Playground Safety Wood Chips, bulk, installed
Supplier QTY (uoMm Unit Price Extended Minimum order
Advanced Mulch, Inc. 14403 |Cubic Yards $37.89 $545,729.67] |50 cubic yards
East Coast Mulch 14403 |Cubic Yards $40.00 $576,120.00] |50 yards
IAMWHOIAM, LLC 14403 |Cubic Yards $155.00| $2,232,465.00] |50 cubic yards

| 10 |Mulch, bulk, installed, brown
Supplier QTY (uoMm Unit Price Extended Minimum order
East Coast Mulch 45000 |Cubic Yards $27.50| $1,237,500.00] |25 yards
Advanced Mulch, Inc. 45000 |Cubic Yards $40.00| $1,800,000.00( |50 cubic yards
IAMWHOIAM, LLC 45000 [Cubic Yards $105.00| $4,725,000.00] [50 cubic yards

| 11 |Mulch, bulk, installed, red
Supplier QTY (uoMm Unit Price Extended Minimum order
East Coast Mulch 12750 |Cubic Yards $27.50 $350,625.00( |25 yards
Advanced Mulch, Inc. 12750 |Cubic Yards $40.00 $510,000.00] |50 cubic yards
IAMWHOIAM, LLC 12750 |Cubic Yards $105.00] $1,338,750.00] |50 cubic yards

| 12 |Mulch, bulk, installed, gold
Supplier QTY (uoMm Unit Price Extended Minimum order
East Coast Mulch 4700 |Cubic Yards $27.50 $129,250.00] |25 yards
Advanced Mulch, Inc. 4700 |Cubic Yards $40.00 $188,000.00] |50 cubic yards
IAMWHOIAM, LLC 4700 |Cubic Yards $105.00 $493,500.00] |50 cubic yards
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Line #

Att #

Attribute Name

Attribute Note

Advanced Mulch,
Inc

East Coast Mulch

IAMWHOIAM, LLC

Header

Delivery Time After
Receipt of Order

Enter the number of calendar days for
delivery time after receipt of order.

Header

Additional Items at
Awarded Contract Price

If awarded the contract resulting from this
bid, will your company agree to sell
additional items at the awarded contract
price? If so state the time period for
additional items to be purchased at the
awarded contract price in calendar days. If
you will not agree to sell additional items at
awarded contract price enter 0.

10

10

Header

Extension of prices, terms
and conditions to other
governmental entities

If awarded the contract resulting from this
bid, will your company agree to extend the
same prices, terms and conditions to other
governmental entities? (Note -- Optional,
agreement not required for contract award.)
Indicate by selecting yes or no from the drop
down menu.

Yes

Yes

Yes

Header

Conflict of Interest

For purposes of determining any possible
conflict of interest, all bidders must disclose
if any City of Pompano Beach employee is
also an owner, corporate officer, or
employee of their business. Indicate either
"Yes" (a City employee is also associated
with your business), or "No". (Note: If
answer is "Yes", you must file a statement
with the Supervisor of Elections, pursuant to
Florida Statutes 112.313.)Indicate yes or no
below with the drop down menu.

No

No

No
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Line #

Att #

Attribute Name

Attribute Note

Advanced Mulch,
Inc

East Coast Mulch

IAMWHOIAM, LLC

Header

Drug-Free Workplace

Whenever two or more bids which are equal
with respect to price, quality, and service are
received for the procurement of
commodities or contractual service, a bid
received from a business that certifies that it
has implemented a Drug-free Workplace
Program shall be given preference in the
award process. If bidder's company has a
Drug-free Workplace Program as outlined in
General Conditions, section 32., indicate that
by selecting yes in the drop down menu.

Yes

Yes

Yes

Header

Vendor Certification
Regarding Scrutinized
Companies Lists (Any
Dollor Amount)

Section 215.4725, Florida Statutes, prohibits
agencies from contracting (at any dollar
amount) with companies on the Scrutinized
Companies that Boycott Israel List, or with
companies that are engaged in a boycott of
Israel. As the person authorized to
electronically sign on behalf of Respondent, |
hereby certify by selecting the box below
that the company responding to this
solicitation is not listed on the Scrutinized
Companies that Boycott Israel List. | also
certify that the company responding to this
solicitation is not participating in a boycott of
Israel, and is not engaged in business
operations in Syria or Cuba. | understand
that pursuant to sections 287.135 and
215.4725, Florida Statutes, the submission of
a false certification may subject company to
civil penalties, attorney’s fees, and/or costs.

Certified

Certified

Certified
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Advanced Mulch,

Line# |Att# |Attribute Name Attribute Note Inc East Coast Mulch IAMWHOIAM, LLC
Check this box to acknowledge that you have
Header | 7 [Acknowledgement of reviewed all addenda issued for this
Addenda solicitation. Yes Yes Yes
Header | 8 Check the box indicating you agree to the
Terms & Conditions terms and conditions of this solicitation. Agree Agree Agree
100 cubic yards per tractor trailer
1 1 50 yards per dump truck see notes
for prices per cubic yard under 100
# of yards per truckload |Mulch, bulk, delivered, red 50 yards / 100 yards |cubic yards
100 cubic yards please see notes
1 2 for prices of orders less than 100
minimum order Mulch, bulk, delivered, red 50 yards cubic yards
100 cubic yards per tractor trailer
5 1 50 yards per dump truck see notes
for prices per cubic yard under 100
# of yards per truckload |[Mulch, bulk, delivered, brown 50 yards / 100 yards |cubic yards
100 cubic yards please see notes
2 2 for prices of orders less than 100
minimum order Mulch, bulk, delivered, brown 50 yards cubic yards
100 cubic yards per tractor trailer
3 1 10 to 50 yards per dump truck see
notes for prices per cubic yard
# of yards per truckload |Mulch, bulk, delivered, gold 50 yards / 100 yards |under 100 cubic yards
100 cubic yards please see notes
3 2 for prices of orders less than 100

minimum order

Mulch, bulk, delivered, gold

50 yards

cubic yards
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Advanced Mulch,

Line# |Att# |Attribute Name Attribute Note Inc East Coast Mulch IAMWHOIAM, LLC
4 1 [# of yards per truckload |Mulch, bulk, delivered, melaleuca 50 yards / 100 yards |50 cubic yards per dump truck
4 2 |minimum order Mulch, bulk, delivered, melaleuca 50 yards 20 cubic yards
5 1 |# of bags per pallet Mulch, bagged, delivered, red 80 bags per pallet 70
5 2 |minimum order Mulch, bagged, delivered, red 15 pallet minimum |20 pallets
6 1 |# of bags per pallet Mulch, bagged, delivered, brown 70 bags per pallet 70
6 2 |minimum order Mulch, bagged, delivered, brown 15 pallet minimum |20 pallets
7 1 |# of bags per pallet Mulch, bagged, delivered, melaleuca 80 bags per pallet 75
7 2 |minimum order Mulch, bagged, delivered, melaleuca 15 pallet minimum 10 pallets
8 1 [minimum order Engineered Wood Fiber, bulk, installed 50 yards 50 cubic yards
9 1 Playground Safety Wood Chips, bulk,

minimum order installed 50 cubic yards 50 yards 50 cubic yards
10 1 [minimum order Mulch, bulk, installed, brown 50 cubic yards 25 yards 50 cubic yards
11 1 |minimum order Mulch, bulk, installed, red 50 cubic yards 25 yards 50 cubic yards
12 1 |minimum order Mulch, bulk, installed, gold 50 cubic yards 25 yards 50 cubic yards
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Responding Supplier Signature Full Name Signature Email Supplier Notes
Advanced Mulch, Inc. Kenneth W. Bowden info@advancedmulch.com
East Coast Mulch Christine Bowden rcmr@comcast.net
SPECIAL ORDERS BULK UNDER 100 CY
50 MINIMUM $47 PER CUBIC YARD
RED, BROWN, GOLD
SPECIAL ORDERS BAGS UNDER 20 PALLETS
IAMWHOIAM, LLC DANIELLE RHODEN iamwhoiamcomany@gmail.com 12 PALLETS MINIMUM 80 BAGS PER PALLET $5.30 per bag
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