Price Analysis

Bid No. PNC2116408B1
Subsurface Facility and Utility Locating Services

c::r"a';";o % Diff.to . % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to
. . . — - High Tech Engineering,| Broward N 9 Broward . Broward UDI - Utility Damage Broward Craig A. Smith & Broward Premiere Design Broward Voluntary Price Broward
GROUP 1 - Traffic Engineering Facilities G1325001B1 Services Inc. Venegroup Services Inc. L . N N
R Inc. County (Award Rescinded ) County County Investigations, LLC County Associates, Inc. County Solutions County Reduction County
2015 Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s)
Item # Item Qty | Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
Standard locate and mark Traffic
PNC2116408B1-- [Engineering Facilities in the area _1@Y, e o o, o, . .
01-01 specified in the SSOCOF ticket, or 65000( each $8.38 $7.04 $457,600.00 16% $7.00 | $455,000.00 16% $8.75 $568,750.00 4% $14.00 $910,000.00 67% $10.00 $650,000.00 19% No Bid No Bid
white lined by Excavator
Emergency locate outside normal work
PNC2116408B1-- [hours (4:01 p.m. to 6:59 a.m.) national o, o E10, o, 449 . .
01-02 holidays and all day Saturday and 40 | each $17.99 $17.99 $719.60 0% $18.00 $720.00 0% $8.75 $350.00 51% $50.00 $2,000.00 178% $10.00 $400.00 44% No Bid No Bid
Sunday
Group 1 Total: $458,319.60 $455,720.00 $569,100.00 $912,000.00 $650,400.00 No Bid
c::r"a';";o % Diff.to USIC Locating % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to
GROUP 2 - Water and Wastewater Service G1325001B1 High Tech Engineering,| Broward T Broward Venegroup Services Inc. Broward ubI - U.tlllty Damage Broward Craig A Smith & Broward Premlere. Design Broward Voluntary'Prlce Broward
R Inc. County (Award Rescinded ) County County Investigations, LLC County Associates, Inc. County Solutions County Reduction County
2015 Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s)
Item # Item Qty | Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
Standard locate and mark Broward
PNC2116408B1- County Water and Wastewater Service
02-01 (WWS) Facilities in the area specified | 19756| each $8.38 $7.04 $139,082.24 -16% $13.00 | $256,828.00 55% $12.49 $246,752.44 49% $14.00 $276,584.00 67% $12.50 $246,950.00 49% No Bid No Bid
in the SSOCOF ticket, or white lined by
Excavator
In-Plant locate and mark Broward
PNC2116408B1- County Water and Wastewater Service
0202 (WWS) Facilities in the area specified 50 | each $8.38 $7.04 $352.00 -16% $13.00 $650.00 55% $15.00 $750.00 79% $100.00 $5,000.00 1093% $12.50 $625.00 49% No Bid No Bid
in the SSOCOF ticket, or white lined by
Excavator
Emergency locate outside normal work
PNC2116408B1-- [hours (5:01 p.m. to 7:59 a.m.) national o, o o o, 219 . .
02-03 holidays and all day Saturday and 20 | each $17.99 $17.99 $359.80 0% $25.00 $500.00 39% $18.75 $375.00 4% $50.00 $1,000.00 178% $12.50 $250.00 31% No Bid No Bid
Sunday
Group 2 Total: $139,794.04 $257,978.00 $247,877.44 $282,584.00 $247,825.00 No Bid
c::r"a';";o % Diff.to e et % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to
* | |High Tech Engineering,| Broward q 9 Broward . Broward UDI - Utility Damage Broward Craig A. Smith & Broward Premiere Design Broward Voluntary Price Broward
GROUP 3 G1325001B1 Services Inc. Venegroup Services Inc. L . N N
R Inc. County (Award Rescinded ) County County Investigations, LLC County Associates, Inc. County Solutions County Reduction County
2015 Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s)
Item # Item Qty | Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
PNC2116408B1-- |Furnish and Install Rigid Standard o o o o . . o
0301 Route Markers (SRM) 25 | each $80.00 $100.00 | $2,500.00 25% $75.00 | $1,875.00 -6% $65.00 $1,625.00 -19% $75.00 $1,875.00 -6% No Bid No Bid $500.00 | $12,500.00 525%
PNC2116408B1- Furnish and Install Utility Locating
03-02 Pavement Markers (Existing 25 | each $30.00 $100.00 $2,500.00 233% $55.00 [ $1,375.00 83% $75.00 $1,875.00 150% $75.00 $1,875.00 150% No Bid No Bid $150.00 $3,750.00 400%
Concrete/Pavement)
PNC2116408B1- Taking Global Positioning System
03-03 (GPS) Coordinates utilizing sub-meter 25 | each $75.00 $500.00 | $12,500.00 567% $50.00 [ $1,250.00 -33% $75.00 $1,875.00 0% $50.00 $1,250.00 -33% No Bid No Bid $100.00 $2,500.00 33%
equipment
Group 3 Total: $17,500.00 $4,500.00 $5,375.00 $5,000.00 No Bid $18,750.00
5 OART OART
corevious e Diftto USIC Locatin % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to e Diffto
‘| |High Tech Engineering, " 9 Broward . Broward UDI - Utility Damage Broward Craig A. Smith & Broward Premiere Design Broward Voluntary Price
GROUP 4 G1325001B1 Broward Services Inc. Venegroup Services Inc. - h q N Broward
Awarded in Inc. County (Award Rescinded) County County Investigations, LLC County Associates, Inc. County Solutions County Reduction County
2015 Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s)
Item # Item Qty | Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
Locate and expose buried
infrastructure with Soft-Dig method non-
PNC2116408B1-- [destructive method, mark and o, 0 o o, . . o,
04-01 document location, depth, size and 40 | each $265.00 $750.00 | $30,000.00 183% $275.00| $11,000.00 4% $355.00 | $14,200.00 34% $350.00 $14,000.00 32% No Bid No Bid $1,500.00 | $60,000.00 466%
type. Fill hole back with clean fill and
restoration
Group 4 Total: $30,000.00 $11,000.00 $14,200.00 $14,000.00 No Bid $60,000.00




Price Analysis

Bid No. PNC2116408B1
Subsurface Facility and Utility Locating Services

Previous % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to % Diff.to
Contract No. " . . from USIC Locating from from - from . . from . . from . from
GROUP 5 - Port Everglades G1325001B1 High Techlf:glneerlng, Broward Services Inc. Broward Venegroup Services Inc. | Broward lljr?vle-sltjimaltiyozzn:_al.g(:e Broward ir:;g:i;tse r:ItI:c& Broward Prerg‘l’ehr:ig::gn Broward Vo:::;:;yti::ce Broward
Awarded in : County (Award Rescinded ) County County 9 ! County T County County County
2015 Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s) Contract(s)
Item # Item Qty | Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
g’g‘_&m 16408B1-- 2;1’;333;2?;3;?:5Tasrgopf‘;’; 2000 | each $9.50 $16.00 | $32,000.00 68% $18.00 | $36,000.00 89% $13.95 | $27,900.00 | 47% $15.00 $30,000.00 58% $15.00 | $30,000.00 58% No Bid No Bid $11.95 | $23,900.00 |  26%
52‘3221 1640881 2;1’;333;2?;3;?:5Tasrgopf‘;’; 1500 | each $10.00 $16.00 | $24,000.00 60% $18.00 | $27,000.00 80% $19.99 | $29,985.00 | 100% $15.00 $22,500.00 50% $2500 | $37,500.00 | 150% No Bid No Bid $14.50 | $21,750.00 |  45%
Emergency Port Locate outside normal
5;‘_‘83211640881“ ::J':):;“;;Sagl g'n";';l‘l’ g;igs:tr:}éay 50 | each $22.00 $80.00 | $4,000.00 264% $35.00 | $1,750.00 59% $25.00 | $1,250.00 14% $50.00 $2,500.00 127% $25.00 $1,250.00 14% No Bid No Bid $15.00 | $750.00 -32%
and Sunday
g’g‘_gf 1640881 '(‘gg?;?:I’q';hn?:r’;‘:ﬂ”if”e"a“”g Radar | 500 | each $12.50 $55.00 | $11,000.00 | 340% $50.00 | $10,000.00 | 300% $37.50 | $7,500.00 | 200% $100.00 $20,000.00 700% $2500 | $5,000.00 100% No Bid No Bid $25.00 | $5,000.00 | 100%
g’g‘_g? 1640881 '(‘5::;3;’:2::2‘) digging and mark 10 | each $650.00 $750.00 | $7,500.00 15% $400.00| $4,000.00 -38% $350.00 | $3,500.00 -46% $325.00 $3,250.00 -50% $199.50 | $1,995.00 -69% No Bid No Bid
55“‘_‘351 16408B1-- (L::fe‘z :g:;‘m digging and mark 10 | each $750.00 $750.00 | $7,500.00 0% $500.00| $5,000.00 -33% $375.00 | $3,750.00 -50% $375.00 $3,750.00 -50% $199.50 | $1,995.00 73% No Bid No Bid
PNC2116408B1 Placement of electrical markers after
05.07 line exposed (markers provided by Port | 25 | each $25.00 $1.00 $25.00 -96% $1.00 | $25.00 -96% $25.00 $625.00 0% $24.00 $600.00 -4% $1.00 $25.00 -96% No Bid No Bid
Everglades)
Group 5 Total: $86,025.00 $83,775.00 $74,510.00 $82,600.00 $77,765.00 No Bid
Voluntary Price Reduction: $15,235.00
Revised Group 5 Total (With VPR) $59,275.00
Bid Total: $731,638.64 $812,973.00 $895,827.44 $1,296,184.00 $975,990.00 $78,750.00

Per CPI data, prices have increased approximately 5.74% since Contract No. G1325001B1 was awarded in 2015.

Voluntary Price reduction was received from Venegroup Services Inc. for Group 5 resulting in a savings of $15,235.
Award Rescinded by the Director of Purchasing on January 3, 2019; USIC cannot perform the requirements of the contract.




