
Event Number E-42-17 Organization City of Pompano Beach, FL

Event Title MULCH - Cooperative Bid Workgroup Purchasing

Event Owner Jeff English

Event Type IFB Email jeffrey.english@copbfl.com

Issue Date 8/21/2017 01:00:00 PM (ET) Phone (954) 786-4098

Close Date 9/28/2017 02:00:00 PM (ET) Fax (954) 786-4168

Responding Supplier City State Response Submitted Lines Responded

Adwood, Inc Lake Worth, FL 9/28/2017 11:10:14 AM (ET) 1, 2, 6, 11 & 12

East Coast Mulch Jupiter FL 9/26/2017 11:34:12 AM (ET) 8, 10, 11 & 13

FORESTRY RESOURCES, INC. FORT MYERS FL 9/25/2017 03:20:30 PM (ET) 1-4, 6, 12, & 14

superior mulch BOYNTON BEACH FL 8/23/2017 02:48:26 PM (ET) 1-6, 12 & 14

ADVANCED MULCH INC PALM BEACH GARDENS FL 9/27/2017 02:07:42 PM (ET) 9-11, 13

Amerigrow Recycling 

(Amerigrow Recycling Delray 

L.P.) Delray Beach FL

9/27/2017 04:25:31 PM (ET) 1-4, 6, 9-14
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1 # of yards per truckload minimum order

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes

East Coast Mulch 20157 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NA

ADVANCED MULCH INC 20157 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Adwood, Inc 20157 Cubic Yards $15.00 $302,355.00 100 Cubic yards 100 Cubic Yards

Amerigrow Recycling (Amerigrow Recycling Delray L.P.)20157 Cubic Yards $16.40 $330,574.80 100 yards 100 yards

superior mulch 20157 Cubic Yards $16.50 $332,590.50 100 100

FORESTRY RESOURCES, INC. 20157 Cubic Yards $21.49 $433,173.93 80 yards 80 yards per truckload - Drop at 1 location only

2 # of yards per truckload minimum order

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes

East Coast Mulch 7400 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

ADVANCED MULCH INC 7400 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Adwood, Inc 7400 Cubic Yards $13.00 $96,200.00 100 Cubic Yards 100 Cubic Yards

Amerigrow Recycling (Amerigrow Recycling Delray L.P.)7400 Cubic Yards $16.50 $122,100.00 100 yards 100 yards

superior mulch 7400 Cubic Yards $17.00 $125,800.00 100 100

FORESTRY RESOURCES, INC. 7400 Cubic Yards $19.69 $145,706.00 80 Yards 80 yards per truckload - Drop at 1 location only

3 # of bags per pallet minimum order

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes

Adwood, Inc 33180 Bags $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

East Coast Mulch 33180 Bags $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

ADVANCED MULCH INC 33180 Bags $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

superior mulch 33180 Bags $1.59 $52,756.20 80 1600 bgs

Amerigrow Recycling (Amerigrow Recycling Delray L.P.)33180 Bags $1.85 $61,383.00 75 bags per pallet 20 pallets

FORESTRY RESOURCES, INC. 33180 Bags $2.09 $69,346.20 70 Bags per pallet - 2CF 1260 Bags per truckload - Drop at 1 location only

4 # of bags per pallet minimum order

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes

Adwood, Inc 44920 Bags $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

East Coast Mulch 44920 Bags $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

ADVANCED MULCH INC 44920 Bags $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

superior mulch 44920 Bags $1.59 $71,422.80 70 1400

Amerigrow Recycling (Amerigrow Recycling Delray L.P.)44920 Bags $1.85 $83,102.00 75 bags per pallet 20 pallets

FORESTRY RESOURCES, INC. 44920 Bags $2.05 $92,086.00 70 Bags per pallet - 2CF 1260 Bags per truckload - Drop at 1 location only

Mulch, bulk, delivered, red

Mulch, bulk, delivered, brown

Mulch, bagged, delivered, red

Mulch, bagged, delivered, brown
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5 # of bags per pallet minimum order

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes

ADVANCED MULCH INC 200 Bags $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

FORESTRY RESOURCES, INC. 200 Bags $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Adwood, Inc 200 Bags $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Amerigrow Recycling (Amerigrow Recycling Delray L.P.)200 Bags $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

East Coast Mulch 200 Bags $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

superior mulch 200 Bags $1.50 $300.00 80 1600

6 # of yards per truckload minimum order

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes

East Coast Mulch 4600 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

ADVANCED MULCH INC 4600 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Adwood, Inc 4600 Cubic Yards $13.00 $59,800.00 100 cubic Yards 100 Cubic Yards

Amerigrow Recycling (Amerigrow Recycling Delray L.P.)4600 Cubic Yards $15.49 $71,254.00 100 yards 100 yards

superior mulch 4600 Cubic Yards $15.50 $71,300.00 100 100

FORESTRY RESOURCES, INC. 4600 Cubic Yards $22.69 $104,374.00 70 Yards 70 yards per truckload - Drop at 1 location only

7 # of bags per pallet minimum order

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes

FORESTRY RESOURCES, INC. 305 Super Sacks $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

superior mulch 305 Super Sacks $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Adwood, Inc 305 Super Sacks $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

East Coast Mulch 305 Super Sacks $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Amerigrow Recycling (Amerigrow Recycling Delray L.P.)305 Super Sacks $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

ADVANCED MULCH INC 305 Super Sacks $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

8 minimum order

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes

ADVANCED MULCH INC 5300 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

FORESTRY RESOURCES, INC. 5300 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Adwood, Inc 5300 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Amerigrow Recycling (Amerigrow Recycling Delray L.P.)5300 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

superior mulch 5300 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID 100

East Coast Mulch 5300 Cubic Yards $35.00 $185,500.00 $35.00 per cu yd - 25 yard minimum 25 yards

Melaleuca mulch, bagged, delivered

Melaleuca mulch, bulk, delivered

Mulch, Rubber, bagged, delivered

Engineered Wood Fiber, bulk, installed
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9 minimum order

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes

Adwood, Inc 9663 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

FORESTRY RESOURCES, INC. 9663 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

East Coast Mulch 9663 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

superior mulch 9663 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID 100

ADVANCED MULCH INC 9663 Cubic Yards $30.25 $292,305.75 $30.25 per cu yd blown-on installation 50 cubic yard minimum

Amerigrow Recycling (Amerigrow Recycling Delray L.P.)9663 Cubic Yards $44.00 $425,172.00 60 yards

10 minimum order

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes

FORESTRY RESOURCES, INC. 23600 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

superior mulch 23600 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Adwood, Inc 23600 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

East Coast Mulch 23600 Cubic Yards $20.00 $472,000.00 $20.00 per cubic yard 50 yards

ADVANCED MULCH INC 23600 Cubic Yards $28.00 $660,800.00 $28.00 per cu yd blown-on installation 50 cubic yard minimum

Amerigrow Recycling (Amerigrow Recycling Delray L.P.)23600 Cubic Yards $30.00 $708,000.00 60 yards

11 minimum order

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes

FORESTRY RESOURCES, INC. 7500 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

superior mulch 7500 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Adwood, Inc 7500 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

East Coast Mulch 7500 Cubic Yards $20.00 $150,000.00 $20.00 per cubic yard 50 yards

ADVANCED MULCH INC 7500 Cubic Yards $28.00 $210,000.00 $28.00 per cu yd blown-on installation 50 cubic yard minimum

Amerigrow Recycling (Amerigrow Recycling Delray L.P.)7500 Cubic Yards $30.00 $225,000.00 60 yards

12 # of yards per truckload minimum order

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes

ADVANCED MULCH INC 700 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

East Coast Mulch 700 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID 25, 50, 100 yards 50 yards

Adwood, Inc 700 Cubic Yards $15.00 $10,500.00 100 cubic yards 100 cubic yars

Amerigrow Recycling (Amerigrow Recycling Delray L.P.)700 Cubic Yards $17.00 $11,900.00 100 yards 100 yards

superior mulch 700 Cubic Yards $17.50 $12,250.00 100 100

FORESTRY RESOURCES, INC. 700 Cubic Yards $24.54 $17,178.00 80 yards 80 yards per truckload - Drop at 1 location only

Mulch, bulk, installed, red

Mulch, bulk, delivered, gold

Playground Safety Wood Chips, bulk, installed

Mulch, bulk, installed, brown
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13 minimum order

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes

FORESTRY RESOURCES, INC. 1300 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

superior mulch 1300 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Adwood, Inc 1300 Cubic Yards $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

East Coast Mulch 1300 Cubic Yards $20.00 $26,000.00 $20.00 per cubic yard

ADVANCED MULCH INC 1300 Cubic Yards $28.00 $36,400.00 $28.00 per cu yd blown-on installation 50 cubic yard minimum

Amerigrow Recycling (Amerigrow Recycling Delray L.P.)1300 Cubic Yards $33.00 $42,900.00 60 yards

14 # of bags per pallet minimum order

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes

Adwood, Inc 19600 Bags $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

ADVANCED MULCH INC 19600 Bags $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

East Coast Mulch 19600 Bags $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NA NA

superior mulch 19600 Bags $1.70 $33,320.00 80 1600 bgs

Amerigrow Recycling (Amerigrow Recycling Delray L.P.)19600 Bags $1.95 $38,220.00 75 bags per pallet 20 pallets

FORESTRY RESOURCES, INC. 19600 Bags $2.33 $45,668.00 70 Bags per pallet - 2CF 1260 Bags per truckload - Drop at 1 location only

Mulch, bulk, installed, gold

Mulch, bagged, delivered, gold
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Line # Att # Attribute Name Adwood, Inc East Coast Mulch FORESTRY RESOURCES, INC.

Superior 

Mulch

ADVANCED 

MULCH INC

Amerigrow Recycling (Amerigrow 

Recycling Delray L.P.)

1
Delivery Time After Receipt of 

Order 10 3 7 2 7 3

2
Additional Items at Awarded 

Contract Price 10 3 180 90 7 3

3

Extension of prices, terms and 

conditions to other 

governmental entities Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes

4 Conflict of Interest No No No No No No

5 Drug-Free Workplace Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

6 Terms & Conditions Agree Agree Agree Agree Agree Agree

1 # of yards per truckload 100 Cubic yards NA 80 yards 100 100 yards

1 minimum order 100 Cubic Yards 80 yards per truckload - Drop at 1 location only 100 100 yards

2 # of yards per truckload 100 Cubic Yards 80 Yards 100 100 yards

2 minimum order 100 Cubic Yards 80 yards per truckload - Drop at 1 location only 100 100 yards

3 # of bags per pallet 70 Bags per pallet - 2CF 80 75 bags per pallet

3 minimum order 1260 Bags per truckload - Drop at 1 location only 1600 bgs 20 pallets

4 # of bags per pallet 70 Bags per pallet - 2CF 70 75 bags per pallet

4 minimum order 1260 Bags per truckload - Drop at 1 location only 1400 20 pallets

5 # of bags per pallet 80

5 minimum order 1600

6 # of yards per truckload 100 cubic Yards 70 Yards 100 100 yards

6 minimum order 100 Cubic Yards 70 yards per truckload - Drop at 1 location only 100 100 yards

7 # of bags per pallet

7 minimum order

8 minimum order 25 yards 100

9 minimum order 100 50 cu yd min 60 yards

10 minimum order 50 yards 50 cu yd min 60 yards

11 minimum order 50 yards 50 cu yd min 60 yards

12 # of yards per truckload 100 cubic yards 25, 50, 100 yards 80 yards 100 100 yards

12 minimum order 100 cubic yars 50 yards 80 yards per truckload - Drop at 1 location only 100 100 yards

13 minimum order 50 cu yd min 60 yards

14 # of bags per pallet NA 70 Bags per pallet - 2CF 80 75 bags per pallet

14
minimum order NA 1260 Bags per truckload - Drop at 1 location only 1600 bgs 20 pallets
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Responding Supplier Signature Full Name Signature Email Supplier Notes

Adwood, Inc Cinton Hodges chodges@atldiversified.com

East Coast Mulch Christine Bowden rcmr@comcast.net

FORESTRY RESOURCES, INC. Kristine Magee Kmagee@gomulch.com

superior mulch CAROL MARRERO CAROL@ATLASPEATANDSOIL.COM

ADVANCED MULCH INC Kenneth W. Bowden info@advancedmulch.com

Amerigrow Recycling 

(Amerigrow Recycling Delray 

L.P.) David Tomlinson info@amerigrow.com

The number of calendar days for delivery time after receipt of order 

for bagged and bulk mulch deliveries is 3 days.

For blow on installation of mulch it is 21 calendar for delivery time 

after receipt of order.
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