From: Lisa L. Wight

To: Andrea Harper; Tammy Leshawn Sartin

Subject: Re: Impact Fee Information - Ocean Park - 1508 N Ocean - Online School Payments Receipt Number
Date: Friday, September 3, 2021 11:10:27 AM

Attachments: KEITH ae81a4cc-7712-4cf5-875e-03dd3c36f472.pna

Outlook-1472148947.png

we will require the county issued plat number to issue the SCAD. Please provide it when you
receive one.

Lisa Wight

Growth Management Planner

Facility Planning and Real Estate

Kathleen C Wright Building

600 Southeast 3rd Avenue, 8th Floor

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301

P:754-321-2172 Please note that I am working remotely and email is the best method of
contact.

lisa.wight@browardschools.com

browardschools.com (or school website)

2]
Under Florida law, e-mail addresses, and all forms of communications, including e-mail
communications, made or received in connection with the transaction of School Board
business are public records, which must be retained as required by law and must be
disclosed upon receipt of a public records request, except as may be excluded by federal
or state laws. If you do not want your e-mail address released in response to a public
records request, do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, contact this office by
phone.
The School Board of Broward County, Florida expressly prohibits bullying, including
cyberbullying, by or towards any student or employee. See Policy 5.9: Anti-Bullying for
additional information.

Dedicated to results, we want to hear from you. Please click on link below for our customer survey:
hitps://www.browardschools.com/Page /35054

From: Andrea Harper <aharper@keithteam.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 1, 2021 10:04 AM

To: Tammy Leshawn Sartin <tammyleshawn.sartin@browardschools.com>

Cc: Lisa L. Wight <lisa.wight@browardschools.com>

Subject: Impact Fee Information - Ocean Park - 1508 N Ocean - Online School Payments Receipt
Number

Googgmorning Tammy,
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Please see attached application and supporting documents for processing in email below. Please let
me know if you need anything else. Thank you

2]

Andrea Harper
Senior Planner
Office: 954.788.3400

Email: aharper@keithteam.com

www.KEITHteam.com

From: Tomas Sinisterra <tomas.sinisterra@strategicproperties.com>

Sent: Tuesday, August 31, 2021 1:12 PM

To: Andrea Harper <aharper@keithteam.com>

Subject: Fwd: Online School Payments Receipt Number 1112011-101243640

Tomas Sinisterra

Principal

P: 1-954-632-5779

E: tomas.sinisterra@strategicproperties.com
i www.strategicproperties.com

H E B

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: <ospadmin@osmsinc.com>

Date: Tue, Aug 31, 2021 at 12:10 PM

Subject: Online School Payments Receipt Number 1112011-101243640
To: <tomas.sinisterra@strategicproperties.com>

Billed To: Order Number: 1112011-
Tomas Sinisterra 101243640

250 NW 25 St, Suite 203 Order Time: 8/31/2021
United States 1:10:25 PM

Miami, FL 33137 Payment Method: Visa
United States Purchase Notes:
9546325779

guest_ STpmtMCM292

BOOO8- Concurrency not $1818.00
Activit Assigned Unit 45 Review - Required
Y y Description Student ; PLAT - not
Name Price Required
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Profile

SubTotal: $1,818.00

Tax: $S0.00
Shipping: $0.00
Service Fee: $S0.00

Grand Total: $1,818.00

Please retain for your records.

P&Z
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