Event Number

T-40-18

Event Title Demolition Services for Elks Lodge and Old Pompano Beach Library

Event Type IFB

Issue Date 6/22/2018 04:03:32 PM (ET)

Close Date 7/20/2018 02:00:00 PM (ET)

Responding Supplier City State Response Submitted Elks Lodge Old Library
Bydemco (Dall Construction Company) Coral Gables FL 7/20/2018 01:59:52 PM (ET) $286,730.00 No Bid
Paragon Construction Unltd. Inc. Pembroke Pines FL 7/20/2018 10:00:20 AM (ET) $175,495.00 $140,119.00
Alpha Wrecking (Camino Real Group Inc) Pompano Beach FL 7/19/2018 05:32:32 PM (ET) $196,260.00 $134,795.00
THE BG GROUP LLC Boca Raton FL 7/20/2018 12:22:40 PM (ET) $226,455.00 $188,910.00
Chin Diesel Inc Pembroke Pines FL 7/19/2018 04:26:48 PM (ET) $277,010.00 $141,960.00
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Bydemco (Dall Const Co.)
1301 S.1H 35
Austin, TX 78741

Paragon Construction Unitd.
Inc., 1497 NW 153 ave
Pembroke Pines, FL 33030

Alpha Wrecking
601 N.W. 12th Avenue, Ste A
Pompano Beach, FL 33069

The BG Group LLC, 1140
Holland Drive #19, Boca
Raton, FL 33487

Chin Diesel Inc
9861 N.W. 3rd Street
Pembroke Pines, FL 33024

Line # |Elks Lodge Property Description QTY [UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
10.1 |Permit Fee Allowance 1 LS $16,000.00 $16,000.00| $16,000.00 $16,000.00| $16,000.00 $16,000.00| $16,000.00f $16,000.00| $16,000.00| $16,000.00
10.2 |Demolition and Disposal of Building |1 LS $221,220.00( $221,220.00f $113,285.00| $113,285.00( $134,654.00 $134,654.00| $156,145.00 $156,145.00| $184,000.00| $184,000.00

Lead Abatement complying with all
10.3 . .

required regulations (refer to report) |1 LS $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00( $30,000.00| $30,000.00

Asbestos Abatement either through

removal of asbestos prior to demo or
10.4 [remediation during demo complying

with all required regulations (refer to

report) 1 LS $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,595.00 $5,595.00| $13,200.00 $13,200.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00
10.5 |Owner's Contingency 1 LS $40,000.00 $40,000.00| $40,000.00 $40,000.00| $40,000.00 $40,000.00| $40,000.00{ $40,000.00| $40,000.00| $40,000.00
10.6 |Indemnification 1 LS $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00

10 |(Elks Lodge Property Total 1 PKG | $286,730.00| $286,730.00| $175,495.00] $175,495.00| $196,260.00 $196,260.00| $226,455.00 $226,455.00| $277,010.00| $277,010.00

Line # |Library Property Description QTY [UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
11.1 |Permit Fee Allowance 1 LS $0.00 No Bid $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00
11.2 |Demolition and Disposal of Building |1 LS $0.00 No Bid| $102,109.00] $102,109.00| $101,895.00 $101,895.00| $151,000.00( $151,000.00| $104,950.00| $104,950.00

Asbestos Abatement either through
removal of asbestos prior to demo or
11.3 |remediation during demo complying
with all required regulations (refer to
report) 1 LS $0.00 No Bid| $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $4,890.00 $4,890.00 $9,900.00 $9,900.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00
11.4 |Owner's Contingency 1 LS $0.00 No Bid[ $20,000.00 $20,000.00| $20,000.00 $20,000.00| $20,000.00{ $20,000.00| $20,000.00| $20,000.00
11.5 |Indemnification 1 LS $0.00 No Bid $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00
11 |[Library Property Total 1 PKG $0.00 No Bid| $140,119.00] $140,119.00| $134,795.00 $134,795.00| $188,910.00| $188,910.00( $141,960.00| $141,960.00
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Bydemco (Dall Paragon Alpha Wrecking
Construction Construction (Camino Real THE BG GROUP
Line# |Attribute Name Company) Unltd. Inc. Group Inc) LLC Chin Diesel Inc
1 |Conflict of Interest No No No No No
2 |Drug-Free Workplace No Yes Yes Yes Yes
Local Business Participation
3 Percentage 30% 10% 100% 0%
4 [Terms & Conditions Agree Agree Agree Agree Agree
5 |Acknowledgement of Addenda |Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
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